BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything
Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UoM

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Pot & Pan Machine Washing Detergent,
Encapsulated Granular Solid,

Maximum of 9 LB/PK

175

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (0Z):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

4-p

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Pot & Pan Machine Washing Detergent,
Granular Powder,

Maximum of 9 LB/PK

175

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (0Z):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

10F9




BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything

Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UoM

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

20-X

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Rinse Additive, Liquid,
1 GL Containers,
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTES

500

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (0Z):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No

Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$7945| § 39,725.0000

Betco

All Temp Rinse Aid

2457400

4

1

GL

79.45

L2

$ 19.86

0.00300000

$ 0.2100

22-7

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Laundry Destainer, Liquid,
55 GL Drum,
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTIONS

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (0Z):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No

Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

20F9




BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything
Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

24-BB

QTY

UoM

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:
Concentrated Laundry Detergent,
Maximum of 5 GL per Pail

50

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

26-DD

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:
Concentrated Laundry Bleach,
5 GL Pails Only,

NO SIZE SUBSTITUTES

75

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

30F9




BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything
Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UoM

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

27-EE

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Concentrated Laundry Bleach,
1 GL Pails Only,
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTIONS

150

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (0Z):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

29-GG

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Fabric Softener, Liquid
55 GL Drum,
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTES

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (0Z):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

40F9




BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything
Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

30-HH

QTY

UoM

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:
Continental Mister Fresh

Odor Encapsulator and Fabric Refresher,
1 QT/PK, 12 PK/CS

NO BRAND, PRODUCT OR SIZE
SUBSTITUTES

36

EA

$ 46.22($ 1,663.9200

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

ECOLAB INC

ZEPHAIR MOUNTAIN MIST
6-320Z RTU

6112043

6

32

oz

L2

50.84

$ 8.47

1.00000000

$ 0.2648

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

33-4J

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Betco Green Earth® Peroxide Cleaner,
Four (4) two (2) liters per CS

NO BRAND, PRODUCT OR SIZE
SUBSTITUTES

40

EA

$ 5882($ 2,352.8000

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

ECOLAB INC

PEROXIDE SURFACE
CLEANER

6100302

1

3

GL

$ 121.28

$ 121.28

0.0078125

$ 0.0030

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

50F9




BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything
Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UoM

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

34-KK

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Continental Multi-Guard Surface Disinfectant,
One (1) QT per PK, twelve (12) PK per CS
NO BRAND, PRODUCT OR SIZE
SUBSTITUTES

180

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

36-MM

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:

Renown Antibacterial Foaming Hand Soap,
1200 mL Cartridge, two (2) per CS

NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE
SUBSTITUTES

50

EA

$ 5059($ 2,529.5000

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

ECOLAB INC

ADV NXA AB FOAM HAND
4X1250ML RTU

6101088

4

1250

ML

$ 50.59

$ 12.65

1.00000000

$ 0.2992

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

6 OF9




BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything
Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UoM

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

37-NN

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:
Commercial Grade Degreaser,

Four (4) one (1) GL Containers ONLY,
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTES

16

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (0Z):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

39-PP

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:
Betco Extreme Floor Stripper,

5 GL Pail,

NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE
SUBSTITUTES

16

EA

$ 7962($ 1,273.9200

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

ECOLAB INC

BRT BLST LW ODR STRP 5
GAL RTU

6101154

1

5

GL

$ 79.62

$ 79.62

0.06250000

$ 0.0078

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

70F9




BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything
Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UoM

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

40-QQ

Betco Express Floor Finish,

5 GL Pail

NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE
SUBSTITUTES

20

EA

$ 8489($ 1,697.8000

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

ECOLAB INC

GEMINI PRO 25 5 GAL RTU

6102139

1

5

GL

84.89

»

$ 84.89

1.00000000

$ 0.1326

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

41-RR

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:
Coromatic Hardwound Roll Towel, White
8.25" x 700'

Six (6) rolls per CS

NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE
SUBSTITUTES

40

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

80F9




BUYER: Clinton Paul

6840 OF
Attachment "B"
Bid Tab

Warewashing

Ecolab, Inc.

Egan Supply Co.

HD Supply

National Paper Co. Inc.
dba National Everything
Wholesale
Alternate

ODP Business Solutions LLC

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

42-QQ

QTY

UoM

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ALTERNATE PRODUCT FOR:
Renown Controlled Hard Roll Towel, Natural
White

8" x 800"

Six (6) rolls per CS

NO BRAND, PRODUCT OR SIZE
SUBSTITUTES

114

EA

Brand Name:

Product Name:

Product Number:

Quantity per Case (CS):

Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:

Unit of Measure (UOM):

Price per CS:

Price per UOM:

Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):

Price per Diluted Ounce (0Z):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

90F9




